

**WAIDE & ASSOCIATES, P.A.**  
**ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW**  
 332 North Spring Street, Tupelo, MS 38804  
 Post Office Box 1357, Tupelo, MS 38802-1357  
 Telephone: (662) 842-7324  
 Facsimile: (662) 842-8056  
 E-mail: [waide@waidelaw.com](mailto:waide@waidelaw.com)

George Dulin

Page: 1  
12/04/2012Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

Interim Statement

Fees

		Hours	
04/18/2007			
	JW Initial meeting with Mr. Dulin	1.50	397.50
	JW Draft EEOC charge of discrimination	1.00	265.00
	JW Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding EEOC charge and attorney-client contract	0.25	66.25
08/31/2007			
	PL Correspondence to EEOC requesting copy of file	0.25	10.00
	PL Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding right to sue letter	0.25	10.00
10/11/2007			
	PL Additional correspondence to EEOC requesting copy of file	0.25	10.00
11/21/2007			
	JW Draft Complaint	1.00	265.00
	PL Prepare civil cover sheet	0.25	10.00
	PL Correspondence to clerk regarding Complaint and filing fee	0.25	10.00
	PL Prepare summonses	0.25	10.00
11/27/2007			
	JW Receive and review notice of assignment	0.25	66.25
01/10/2008			
	PL Correspondence to process server regarding service of process	0.25	10.00
01/31/2008			
	JW Receive and review Defendant's Answer to Complaint	0.50	132.50
02/01/2008			
	PL Correspondence to opposing counsel regarding depositions	0.25	10.00
02/11/2008			
	PL Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding telephonic case		

**EXHIBIT "A"**

George Dulin

Page: 2

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
	management conference	0.25	10.00
JW	Receive and review Rule 16.1 Order	0.25	66.25
04/04/2008			
PL	Prepare pre-discovery disclosures of core information	3.75	150.00
04/07/2008			
PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding medical authorization	0.25	10.00
04/08/2008			
RW	Review and revise pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.50	100.00
PL	Prepare notice of service of pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25	10.00
RW	Prepare confidential settlement memorandum	0.75	150.00
04/11/2008			
RW	Receive and review Defendant's pre-discovery disclosures of core information	1.00	200.00
04/15/2008			
PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding filing fee	0.25	10.00
04/23/2008			
RW	Prepare for and participate in telephonic case management conference	0.50	100.00
04/24/2008			
PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding final pretrial conference and trial dates	0.25	10.00
JW	Receive and review Notice of Jury Trial	0.25	66.25
04/30/2008			
PL	Correspondence to Dr. John Marascalco regarding Mr. Dulin's medical records	0.25	10.00
05/01/2008			
PL	Correspondence to Dr. Sethelle Flowers regarding Mr. Dulin's medical records	0.25	10.00
05/06/2008			
PL	Draft initial discovery requests to be propounded to Defendant	2.00	80.00
JW	Review and revise initial discovery requests to be propounded to Defendant	0.50	132.50
PL	Prepare notice of service of initial discovery requests	0.25	10.00
05/15/2008			
RW	Receive and review medical records and bills from Dr. Marascalco	0.50	100.00

George Dulin

Page: 3

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
05/22/2008			
	PL	Draft first supplement pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.50 20.00
	RW	Review and approve first supplemental pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25 50.00
	PL	Draft notice of service of first supplemental pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25 10.00
05/23/2008			
	RW	Receive and review Defendant's initial discovery requests to Plaintiff	0.50 100.00
05/29/2008			
	PL	Draft notices of deposition for Sammy Foster, Walter Parker, Gladys Flagg, Brian Waldrop, Alex Malouf, Robert Moore, Willie Perkins, and David Jordan	0.50 20.00
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding depositions	0.25 10.00
	PL	Correspondence to process server regarding deposition subpoenas	0.25 10.00
05/30/2008			
	PL	Draft second supplemental pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.50 20.00
	RW	Review and approve second supplemental pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25 50.00
	PL	Draft notice of service of second supplemental pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25 10.00
	RW	Receive and review medical records and bills from Dr. Flowers	0.50 100.00
06/02/2008			
	RW	Receive and review notice of deposition of George Dulin	0.25 50.00
06/03/2008			
	PL	Prepare responses to interrogatories and requests for production of documents, including telephone conference with Mr. Dulin	1.75 70.00
06/04/2008			
	PL	Complete preparation of responses to interrogatories and requests for production of documents	1.25 50.00
06/05/2008			
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding verification of discovery responses	0.25 10.00
06/10/2008			
	RW	Receive and review Defendant's discovery responses	0.50 100.00
06/12/2008			
	JW	Attend deposition of Brian Waldrop	0.25 66.25
	JWT	Travel to/from Greenwood, MS, for depositions of Brian Waldrop, Walter Parker, David Jordan, Willie Perkins, Alex Malouf, Gladys Flagg, and Sammy Foster	5.00 662.50

George Dulin

Page: 4

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
	JW	Attend deposition of Walter Parker	0.50 132.50
	JW	Attend deposition of David Jordan	0.50 132.50
	JW	Attend deposition of Willie Perkins	0.25 66.25
	JW	Attend deposition of Alex Malouf	0.50 132.50
	JW	Attend deposition of Gladys Flagg	0.25 66.25
	JW	Attend deposition of Sammy Foster	1.00 265.00
06/13/2008			
	JW	Attend depositions of Mr. Dulin and Robert Moore	2.00 530.00
	PL	Draft notices of deposition of Bob Darden, W.M. Sanders, and Jerry Adams	0.25 10.00
	JWT	Travel to/from Greenwood, MS, for depositions of Mr. Dulin and Robert Moore	5.00 662.50
06/20/2008			
	PL	Prepare notice of service of discovery responses	0.25 10.00
	RW	Review and revise discovery responses	0.50 100.00
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding discovery requests	0.25 10.00
06/23/2008			
	JW	Receive and review Defendant's motion for extension of time to file counterclaim	0.25 66.25
06/26/2008			
	JW	Receive and review order granting motion for time to file counterclaim	0.25 66.25
06/27/2008			
	JW	Receive and review second motion for time to file counterclaim	0.25 66.25
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding reading and signing his deposition	0.25 10.00
07/01/2008			
	JW	Attend deposition of Jerry Adams	0.25 66.25
	JW	Attend deposition of Bob Darden	0.50 132.50
	JWT	Travel to/from Greenwood, MS, for depositions of Bob Darden and Jerry Adams	5.00 662.50
07/02/2008			
	JW	Receive and review order granting second motion for time to file counterclaim	0.25 66.25
	PL	Correspondence to Advanced Court Reporting regarding depositions	0.25 10.00
07/03/2008			
	JW	Receive and review amended answer to complaint and first counterclaim	0.50 132.50
07/04/2008			
	PL	Prepare notice of service of discovery responses	0.25 10.00

George Dulin

Page: 5

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
	RW	Review and revise discovery responses	0.50 100.00
07/09/2008	RW	Receive and review notice of reassignment	0.25 50.00
07/15/2008	RW	Receive and review Defendant's second set of requests for production of documents to Plaintiff	0.25 50.00
07/16/2008	JW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding counterclaim	0.25 66.25
07/17/2008	JW	Draft memorandum to file regarding liability insurance	0.25 66.25
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding additional depositions	0.25 10.00
	JW	Correspondence to Mr. King at Westport Insurance regarding counterclaim	0.25 66.25
	JW	Draft reply to counterclaim	1.00 265.00
	JW	Attend deposition of W.M. Sanders	0.50 132.50
	JWT	Travel to/from Greenwood, MS, for deposition of W.M. Sanders	5.00 662.50
07/31/2008	JW	Draft responses to Defendant's second set of requests for production of documents	0.50 132.50
	PL	Draft notice of service of responses to Defendant's second set of requests for production of documents	0.25 10.00
08/27/2008	PL	Prepare responses to Defendant's third set of requests for production of documents, including telephone conference with Mr. Dulin	0.75 30.00
	PL	Draft Notice of Service of Plaintiff's Responses to Third Set of Requests for Production of Documents	0.25 10.00
	RW	Review and revise Plaintiff's Responses to Third Set of Requests for Production of Documents	0.25 50.00
09/11/2008	JW	Receive and review notice of entry of appearance of William M. Beasley	0.25 66.25
09/18/2008	JW	Receive and review first set of interrogatories, requests for production of documents, and requests for admissions propounded by William M. Beasley	0.50 132.50
09/26/2008	JW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding medical records	0.25 66.25

George Dulin

Page: 6

12/04/2012

Account No:

107-050

Statement No:

8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
10/15/2008			
JW	Receive and review Defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to Plaintiff's discovery requests	0.25	66.25
10/22/2008			
JW	Receive and review order granting Defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to Plaintiff's discovery requests	0.25	66.25
10/28/2008			
JW	Receive and review correspondence from Dr. Flowers	0.25	66.25
11/06/2008			
RW	Draft designation of expert witnesses	1.00	200.00
PL	Prepare notice of service of Plaintiff's first designation of expert witnesses	0.25	10.00
02/12/2009			
JW	Receive and review motion to continue trial and reset deadlines	0.50	132.50
02/17/2009			
JW	Prepare response to motion to continue trial and reset deadlines	0.50	132.50
02/23/2009			
JW	Receive and review order granting motion to continue trial	0.25	66.25
JW	Receive and review notice of trial	0.25	66.25
JW	Receive and review notice of attorney appearance by Stephen Joseph Cramblitt, Jr.	0.25	66.25
02/24/2009			
PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding new trial date	0.25	10.00
02/25/2009			
JW	Receive and review notice of final pretrial conference	0.25	66.25
JW	Correspondence to Ms. Desmond regarding settlement	0.25	66.25
JW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding settlement	0.25	66.25
03/06/2009			
JW	Receive and review scheduling order	0.25	66.25
03/09/2009			
PL	Prepare third supplement pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.50	20.00
PL	Draft notice of service of third pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25	10.00
JW	Review and approve third supplement pre-discovery disclosures of core information	0.25	66.25
03/20/2009			
JW	Receive and review motion for resetting trial filed by William M.		

George Dulin

Page: 7

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
	Beasley	0.25	66.25
04/15/2009			
	JW	0.25	66.25
	JW	0.25	66.25
04/17/2009			
	JW	0.25	66.25
04/20/2009			
	PL	0.25	10.00
04/24/2009			
	JW	0.25	66.25
04/29/2009			
	JW	0.25	66.25
05/07/2009			
	JW	2.25	596.25
	JWT	5.00	662.50
	RW	0.50	100.00
05/08/2009			
	LF	1.50	262.50
	LFT	5.50	481.25
	JW	0.25	66.25
05/22/2009			
	LF	2.25	393.75
	LFT	6.50	568.75
06/02/2009			
	PL	0.25	10.00
06/05/2009			
	LF	1.25	218.75
	LFT	5.00	437.50
06/11/2009			
	PL	0.50	20.00

George Dulin

Page: 8

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
06/12/2009	JW	Receive and review supplemental responses to interrogatories by Defendant Board of Commissioners of the Greenwood Leflore Hospital	0.50 132.50
06/24/2009	JW	Draft Motion for Extension of Case Management Order Deadlines and proposed Order	0.50 132.50
	JW	Receive and review Response to Motion to Extend Case Management Order Deadlines	0.50 132.50
06/25/2009	PL	Draft responses to discovery requests propounded by Defendant Robert Moore	2.50 100.00
	RW	Review and revise responses to discovery requests	0.75 150.00
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding supplemental discovery responses	0.25 10.00
06/26/2009	JW	Draft Motion to Bifurcate Trial	0.50 132.50
	JW	Draft Memorandum Brief in Support of Motion to Bifurcate Trial	1.50 397.50
06/29/2009	JW	Receive and review Motion for Summary Judgment and supporting Memorandum Brief by Defendant Board of Commissioners of the Greenwood Leflore Hospital	0.75 198.75
	JW	Receive and review Motion for Summary Judgment Dismissing Counterclaim of Defendant Board of Commissioners of the Greenwood Leflore Hospital and supporting Memorandum Brief	0.50 132.50
06/30/2009	JW	Receive and review Motion to Substitute Affidavits	0.25 66.25
07/01/2009	RW	Begin preparation of Response to Motion for Summary Judgment	2.25 450.00
07/02/2009	RW	Continue preparation of Response to Motion for Summary Judgment	3.50 700.00
	JW	Receive and review Order finding as moot Motion to Extend Motions Deadline	0.25 66.25
	PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding signing deposition	0.25 10.00
07/06/2009	RW	Prepare Response to Motion for Summary Judgment filed by Defendant Board of Commissioners of the Greenwood Leflore Hospital	2.50 500.00



George Dulin

Page: 10

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
07/23/2009	JW	0.75	198.75
08/03/2009	JW	0.25	66.25
08/07/2009	JW	0.25	66.25
08/10/2009	PL	0.25	10.00
08/11/2009	JW	0.75	198.75
	JW	4.25	1,126.25
08/13/2009	JW	0.75	198.75
	JW	0.75	198.75
08/20/2009	JW	0.50	132.50
	JW	2.75	728.75
08/24/2009	PL	0.25	10.00
	PL	0.50	20.00
	JW	0.25	66.25
08/25/2009	PL	0.25	10.00
	PL	0.50	20.00
08/28/2009	JW	0.50	132.50

George Dulin

Page: 11

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
09/08/2009			
JW	Receive and review Order on motion for summary judgment	0.75	198.75
09/09/2009			
JW	Receive and review correspondence from Ms. Desmond with Defendant Board's trial exhibits	0.50	132.50
09/10/2009			
JW	Receive and review Notice of Resetting of Final Pretrial Conference	0.25	66.25
09/11/2009			
JW	Draft Plaintiff's portion of Final Pretrial Order	3.50	927.50
JW	Participate in Final Pretrial Conference	1.00	265.00
09/12/2009			
JW	Make revisions to Final Pretrial Order	0.75	198.75
09/14/2009			
JW	Receive and review notice of attorney appearance by Karen Clay	0.25	66.25
JW	Receive and review motion to transfer trial to Greenville	0.50	132.50
09/15/2009			
JW	Draft response in opposition to motion to transfer trial	0.50	132.50
09/21/2009			
JW	Receive and review Order denying motion to transfer trial	0.25	66.25
09/24/2009			
JW	Draft motion to continue trial	0.25	66.25
09/25/2009			
JW	Receive and review Notice Resetting Trial	0.25	66.25
PL	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding resetting trial	0.25	10.00
09/28/2009			
JW	Receive and review motion for reconsideration regarding order on motion for miscellaneous relief	0.25	66.25
10/12/2009			
JW	Draft response to motion for reconsideration	1.50	397.50
10/15/2009			
JW	Receive and review Order denying motion for reconsideration	0.50	132.50
01/06/2010			
JW	Draft motion for special interrogatories	0.50	132.50
PL	Correspondence to Ms. Desmond regarding witness fees	0.25	10.00

George Dulin

Page: 12  
12/04/2012Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
01/08/2010			
	JW	Receive and review motion <i>in limine</i>	0.75 198.75
	JW	Receive and review Defendant Board's jury instructions	0.50 132.50
	PL	Prepare and file Plaintiff's exhibit list	1.00 40.00
01/12/2010			
	PLT	Travel to/from Greenwood, Mississippi, for service of subpoenas and interview of Jerry Adams	7.50 150.00
01/15/2010			
	JW	Conference with Mr. Dulin	3.50 927.50
	JW	Prepare for trial	4.50 1,192.50
	JW	Draft response in opposition to motion <i>in limine</i>	0.75 198.75
	PL	Draft and file proof of service of subpoenas on Jerry Adams, Robert Darden, and Robert Moore	0.50 20.00
01/16/2010			
	JW	Prepare for trial	7.50 1,987.50
01/17/2010			
	JW	Prepare for trial	5.75 1,523.75
01/18/2010			
	JW	Prepare for trial	7.75 2,053.75
01/19/2010			
	JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, Mississippi, for attendance trial	1.50 198.75
	JW	Attend trial and prepare for following day of trial	11.50 3,047.50
01/20/2010			
	JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, Mississippi, for attendance at trial	1.50 198.75
	JW	Attend trial and prepare for following day of trial	10.75 2,848.75
01/21/2010			
	JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, Mississippi, for attendance at trial	1.50 198.75
	JW	Attend trial	1.50 397.50
01/28/2010			
	JW	Draft Notice of Appeal	0.50 132.50
06/09/2010			
	JW	Draft "facts" portion of Fifth Circuit brief of Appellant	5.75 1,523.75
06/23/2010			
	JW	Draft "argument" portion of Fifth Circuit brief of Appellant	7.75 2,053.75
06/25/2010			
	JW	Continue drafting Appellant's brief	4.75 1,258.75

George Dulin

Page: 13

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
07/15/2010	PL	1.50	60.00
	JW	5.75	1,523.75
09/07/2010	JW	2.75	728.75
10/01/2010	JW	3.50	927.50
10/04/2010	JW	2.50	662.50
10/05/2010	JW	3.75	993.75
07/08/2011	JW	0.50	132.50
07/18/2011	PL	0.25	10.00
07/20/2011	JW	5.75	1,523.75
07/21/2011	JW	4.25	1,126.25
08/17/2011	JW	1.50	397.50
09/15/2011	JW	0.50	132.50
09/26/2011	JW	0.25	66.25
10/03/2011	JW	1.50	397.50
10/24/2011	JW	0.50	132.50
11/01/2011	JW	0.25	66.25

George Dulin

Page: 14

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
12/13/2011			
JW	Receive and review Notice of Jury Trial	0.25	66.25
12/14/2011			
JW	Receive and review Notice of Final Pretrial Conference	0.25	66.25
03/07/2012			
JW	Receive and review notice canceling final pretrial conference	0.25	66.25
03/21/2012			
JW	Receive and review Motion to Appear <i>Pro Hac Vice</i> by Daisy Gurdian	0.25	66.25
PL	Prepare subpoenas for Robert Darden, Willie Perkins, David Jordan, and Robert Moore	1.00	40.00
03/22/2012			
JW	Receive and review Order granting Motion to Appear <i>Pro Hac Vice</i> by Daisy Gurdian	0.25	66.25
03/29/2012			
JW	Draft motion to utilize form of the verdict	0.50	132.50
RPW	Draft entry of appearance	0.25	50.00
04/03/2012			
RPW	Receive and review motion to quash subpoenas	0.50	100.00
04/05/2012			
RPW	Draft response to motion to quash subpoenas, including research regarding same	2.25	450.00
RPW	Receive and review order denying motion to quash	0.50	100.00
04/06/2012			
JW	Prepare for trial	5.75	1,523.75
RPW	Prepare for trial	3.50	700.00
04/07/2012			
JW	Prepare for trial	6.75	1,788.75
RPW	Prepare for trial	6.50	1,300.00
04/08/2012			
JW	Prepare for trial, including meeting with Mr. Dulin	9.50	2,517.50
RPW	Prepare for trial	4.75	950.00
04/09/2012			
RPT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	150.00
JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	198.75
RPW	Attend trial and prepare for following day of trial	10.25	2,050.00
JW	Attend trial and prepare for following day of trial	11.50	3,047.50

George Dulin

Page: 15

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
04/10/2012			
JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	198.75
RPT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	150.00
RPW	Attend trial and prepare for trial on April 12, 2012	9.75	1,950.00
JW	Attend trial and prepare for trial on April 12, 2012	11.00	2,915.00
04/11/2012			
JW	Prepare for trial	5.75	1,523.75
RPW	Prepare for trial	6.50	1,300.00
04/12/2012			
RPT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	150.00
JWT	Travel to/from Aberdeen, MS, for attendance at trial	1.50	198.75
JW	Attend trial	4.25	1,126.25
RPW	Attend trial	4.25	850.00
04/13/2012			
RPW	Draft motion for extension of time to file Plaintiff's motion for attorneys' fees	0.50	100.00
04/19/2012			
RPW	Receive and review order granting motion for time to file Plaintiff's motion for attorneys' fees	0.25	50.00
05/25/2012			
RPW	Receive and review motion for extension of time to file post-hearing motions	0.25	50.00
RPW	Receive and review correspondence from Ms. Desmond regarding motion for extension of time to file post-hearing motions; reply correspondence to Ms. Desmond	0.25	50.00
RPW	Receive and review order denying motion for extension of time to file post-hearing motions	0.25	50.00
RPW	Receive and review motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur and supporting memorandum brief	1.50	300.00
RPW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur and supporting memorandum brief	0.25	50.00
05/31/2012			
RPW	Prepare response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	1.00	200.00
RPW	Begin preparation of memorandum brief in response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	5.25	1,050.00

George Dulin

Page: 16

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050

Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
06/01/2012	RPW	Continue preparation of memorandum brief in response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	3.50 700.00
06/05/2012	RPW	Draft motion for extension of time to file response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.50 100.00
	RPW	Receive and review order granting motion for extension of time to file response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.25 50.00
06/11/2012	JW	Review and revise memorandum brief in response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.75 198.75
06/15/2012	RPW	Final revisions to memorandum brief in response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	1.25 250.00
06/18/2012	RPW	Receive and review Defendant's motion for time to file reply to Plaintiff's response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.25 50.00
	RPW	Receive and review order granting Defendant's motion for extension of time to file reply to Plaintiff's response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.25 50.00
	RPW	Receive and review correspondence from Ms. Desmond regarding extension of time to file Defendant's reply to Plaintiff's response to motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur; reply correspondence to Ms. Desmond	0.25 50.00
07/06/2012	RPW	Receive and review Defendant's response to Plaintiff's opposition to Defendant's motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.75 150.00

George Dulin

Page: 17

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

		Hours	
07/09/2012	RPW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding Defendant's response to Plaintiff's opposition to Defendant's motion for judgment as a matter of law, alternative motion for new trial, alternative motion to amend judgment, and alternative motion for remittitur	0.25 50.00
11/20/2012	RPW	Receive and review Memorandum Opinion and Order from Court denying Motion for Judgment NOV; denying Motion for Judgment as a Matter of Law; denying Motion for New Trial; denying Motion to Set Aside Verdict; and denying Motion to Alter Judgment	0.25 50.00
	RPW	Telephone conference with Mr. Dulin regarding Memorandum Opinion and Order from Court denying Motion for Judgment NOV; denying Motion for Judgment as a Matter of Law; denying Motion for New Trial; denying Motion to Set Aside Verdict; and denying Motion to Alter Judgment	0.25 50.00
11/21/2012	RPW	Correspondence to Mr. Dulin regarding Memorandum Opinion and Order from Court denying Motion for Judgment NOV; denying Motion for Judgment as a Matter of Law; denying Motion for New Trial; denying Motion to Set Aside Verdict; and denying Motion to Alter Judgment and possibility of appeal	0.25 50.00
		For Current Services Rendered	420.00 86,916.25

## Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
Jim Waide	224.75	\$265.00	\$59,558.75
Ron Woodruff	26.00	200.00	5,200.00
Luke Fisher	5.00	175.00	875.00
Jim Waide Travel	34.00	132.50	4,505.00
Rachel Pierce Waide	66.50	200.00	13,300.00
Paralegal	34.75	40.00	1,390.00
Rachel M. Pierce Travel	4.50	100.00	450.00
Luke Fisher Travel	17.00	87.50	1,487.50
Paralegal Travel	7.50	20.00	150.00

Expenses

12/12/2007	Overnight Delivery expense paid to FedEx	13.08
05/09/2008	Photocopy charges paid to Marascalco Dermatology Clinic for medical records	20.00
05/20/2008	Photocopy charges paid to Dr. Sethelle Flowers for medical records	35.00
05/30/2008	Photocopy charges	0.75
05/30/2008	Postage	0.42
05/30/2008	Postage	0.75
06/12/2008	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS, for depositions of Brian Waldrop, Walter	

George Dulin

Page: 18

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

	Parker, David Jordan, Willie Perkins, Alex Malouf, Gladys Flagg, and Sammy Foster	117.00
06/13/2008	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS for deposition of Mr. Dulin	117.00
06/19/2008	Photocopy charges	0.45
06/19/2008	Postage	0.59
06/19/2008	Postage	0.42
07/01/2008	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS, for depositions of Bob Darden and Jerry Adams	135.72
07/02/2008	Paid deposition cost to Advanced Court Reporting for the depositions of Sammy Foster, Walter Parker, Gladys Flaggs, Alex Malouf, Brian Waldrop, Willie Perkins, David Jordon, Robert Moore, and George Dulin	1,117.85
07/15/2008	Paid deposition cost to Advanced Court Reporting for the depositions of Bob Darden and Jerry Adams	249.55
07/17/2008	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS, for deposition of W.M. Sanders	135.72
07/18/2008	Photocopy charges	1.50
07/18/2008	Postage	0.59
07/22/2008	Photocopy charges	1.65
07/24/2008	Postage	1.18
07/30/2008	Paid deposition cost to Advanced Court Reporting for the deposition of W.M. Sanders	200.65
08/13/2008	Photocopy charges	0.45
08/21/2008	Postage	0.84
10/13/2008	Postage	0.42
10/13/2008	Postage	0.59
02/12/2009	Photocopy charges	0.60
02/12/2009	Postage	1.26
03/02/2009	Photocopy charges paid to Dr. Sethelle Flowers for medical records	35.00
03/04/2009	Photocopy charges paid to Marascalco Dermatology Clinic for medical record	25.00
05/07/2009	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS for 30(b)(6) deposition of Brian Waldrop	128.70
05/08/2009	Postage	0.76
05/08/2009	Mileage to/from Cleveland, MS, for deposition	176.30
05/22/2009	Mileage to/from Ridgeland for deposition	210.25
06/05/2009	Mileage to/from Greenwood, MS, for deposition	145.94
06/12/2009	Paid deposition cost to Verbatim Court Reporting for the deposition of Dr. Sethelle Flowers	163.50
06/12/2009	Paid deposition cost to Jan Allen for the deposition of Brian Waldrop	186.55
06/12/2009	Paid deposition cost to Betty Ashmore, CSR for the deposition of Jason Morris, M.D.	79.45
07/01/2009	Paid deposition cost to Jan Allen for the deposition of George Dulin	91.10
01/12/2010	Mileage to/from Greenwood for service of subpoena upon Jerry Adams	146.85
01/20/2010	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for assistance with trial (Jerry Young)	35.00
01/30/2010	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for delivery of documents to trial (Lea Waide)	39.34
03/30/2010	Postage	0.61
04/16/2010	Overnight Delivery expense paid to FedEx	16.94
10/15/2010	Overnight Delivery expense paid to FedEx	17.02
07/28/2011	Overnight Delivery expense paid to FedEx	76.50
09/20/2011	Travel expense: Meals (Greenwood Commonwealth - Greenwood, MS)	6.00
04/08/2012	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for trial preparation with Mr. Dulin	41.25

George Dulin

Page: 19

12/04/2012

Account No: 107-050  
Statement No: 8365

## Attorneys' Fees and Expenses

04/09/2012	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, to take trial notebooks to Jim (Patricia Nowlin)	44.00
04/09/2012	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for trial	41.25
04/09/2012	Travel expense: Meals (Penny Lanes Java Cafe - Aberdeen, MS)	41.07
04/10/2012	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for trial	41.25
04/10/2012	Travel expense: Meals (Penny Lanes Java Cafe - Aberdeen, MS)	40.27
04/12/2012	Mileage to/from Aberdeen, MS, for trial	41.25
04/12/2012	Travel expense: Meals (The Cottage Tea Room - Aberdeen, MS)	31.92
	Total Expenses	4,057.10

Advances

11/21/2007	Filing fee paid to USDC Clerk	350.00
01/10/2008	Processor fee paid to Jeff Dunn for service of summons and complaint upon Defendants	70.00
05/30/2008	Witness fees for depositions paid to Robert Moore, David Jordan, and Willie Perkins	120.00
05/30/2008	Processor fee paid to Jeff Dunn for service of deposition subpoenas	105.00
06/19/2008	Witness fee paid to Bob Darden for deposition	40.00
06/19/2008	Processor fee paid to Jeff Dunn for service of deposition subpoena	35.00
10/21/2008	Processor fee paid to Jeff Dunn for services of Complaint	35.00
10/21/2008	Processor fee paid to Jeff Dunn for service of Complaint upon new defendants	35.00
01/26/2010	Witness fee paid to Robert Darden	189.16
02/15/2010	Filing fee paid to USDC clerk for appeal to USCA (credit card)	455.00
03/26/2010	Transcription fees paid to Phyllis McLarty for trial transcript	1,770.25
03/14/2012	Witness fee to David Jordan (check #10794)	165.46
03/14/2012	Witness fee to Robert Moore (check #10795)	165.46
03/14/2012	Witness fee to Willie Perkins (check #10792)	165.46
03/14/2012	Processor fee to Leflore County Sheriff's Department for service of subpoenas	105.00
03/14/2012	Witness fee to Robert Darden (check #10797)	178.21
03/14/2012	Witness fee to Sharkey Ford (check #10798)	50.00
	Total Advances	4,034.00
	Total Current Work	95,007.35
	Balance Due	<u>\$95,007.35</u>